
Dr Nandakumar Natarajan

MS (Ortho), DNB(Ortho), FIJR(UK), Fellowship in Sports Medicine, Cardiff(UK) 9 + Years experience

Dr Nandakumar Natarajan is a top Orthopedician in Chennai at Apollo Speciality Hospitals O M
R . Book appointment online with Dr Nandakumar Natarajan at Ask Apollo.

Hospitals
Apollo Speciality Hospitals, OMR, Chennai ,

Doctor's Working
Weekdays
Mon - Sat

Doctor's
Working Hours

16:00 -17:00

Doctor's Slot Timings
MON - 16:00 -17:00 TUE - 16:00 -17:00 WED - 16:00 -17:00 THU -

16:00 -17:00 FRI - 16:00 -17:00 SAT - 16:00 -17:00

Overview
Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan is a dedicated Orthopaedician based in Chennai, Tamil Nadu, bringing
over 9 years of extensive experience in the field of orthopaedic surgery. He holds a prestigious
qualification including MBBS, MS in Orthopaedic Surgery, and DNB in Orthopaedics, showcasing his
commitment to excellence and advanced knowledge in musculoskeletal health. Dr. Natarajan is
passionate about providing high-quality care to his patients and is proficient in both Tamil and
English, ensuring effective communication and personalized treatment. His expertise spans a wide
range of orthopaedic conditions, catering to the diverse needs of his patients. As a member of the
SPECTRA network, he adheres to elevated standards of care and continually seeks to enhance his
skills through ongoing professional development. Patients can expect a comprehensive approach to
diagnosis and treatment, focused on improving functionality and quality of life. Dr. Natarajan is well-
respected among his peers and patients alike, and his commitment to patient-centered care is
evident in the positive outcomes he achieves. Whether dealing with sports injuries, congenital
disorders, or degenerative diseases, Dr. Natarajan provides evidence-based treatment options tailored
to each individual's situation. If you are seeking a compassionate and skilled orthopaedic specialist in
Chennai, Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan is an excellent choice.

Experience
Senior Consultant Joint Replacement & Arthroscopy Surgeon

Research and Publication

Frequently Asked Questions

https://dev-apollohospitals-d10.specbee.site/hospitals/apollo-speciality-hospitals-omr-chennai


1. Where does Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan practice?

Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan's medical practice is located at Apollo Speciality Hospitals, O M R. This
hospital offers comprehensive healthcare services.

2. Who is Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan?

Dr Nandakumar Natarajan is a renowned Orthopaedic Surgeon with over 9 years of experience. He
practices in Chennai at Apollo Speciality Hospitals O M R. Dr Nandakumar Natarajan holds a degree
in MS (Ortho), DNB(Ortho), FIJR(UK), Fellowship in Sports Medicine, Cardiff(UK). He provides
treatments including Joint Replacement Surgery, Arthroscopy, Fracture Fixation. He specializes in
treating conditions like Osteoarthritis, Fractures, Sports Injuries.

3. Why do patients choose Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan?

Patients seek Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan's expertise for Primary Knee Replacements, Revision Knee
Replacements, and Primary Hip Replacements. For a detailed overview of his services, please refer to
his professional profile.

4. What is Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan's specialization?

Dr Nandakumar Natarajan specializes in Orthopaedics. He has expertise in treating conditions such as
Osteoarthritis, Fractures, Sports Injuries. His key treatments include Joint Replacement Surgery,
Arthroscopy, Fracture Fixation.

5. What are Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan's medical qualifications?

Dr Nandakumar Natarajan holds MS (Ortho), DNB(Ortho), FIJR(UK), Fellowship in Sports Medicine,
Cardiff(UK), reflecting his comprehensive education in the field of Orthopaedics.

6. What is Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan's experience?

Dr. Nandakumar Natarajan has nine years of experience in orthopedics.

7. Who is an Orthopedist?

An orthopedist is a physician specializing in the diagnosis and treatment of musculoskeletal disorders.
They address conditions affecting bones, muscles, joints, and ligaments, including arthritis, back pain,
sports injuries, and leg/foot pain. Orthopedic care encompasses a range of skeletal system problems.

8. What is the difference between an Orthopaedist and an Orthopaedic Surgeon?

While often used interchangeably, orthopaedists and orthopaedic surgeons differ in their scope of
practice. Orthopaedists manage musculoskeletal system conditions, offering pre- and post-surgical
care. Orthopaedic surgeons provide the same care but additionally perform surgical procedures for
conditions such as back pain, disc herniation, bone tumors, carpal tunnel syndrome, and arthritis.

9. Does an Orthopedic Specialist Treat Foot and Ankle Issues?

Yes, orthopedic specialists treat musculoskeletal conditions, including foot and ankle problems. They
manage common conditions such as bunions, ankle sprains, arthritis, and sports injuries. Diagnosis
often involves imaging, and treatment varies depending on the condition's severity.

10. Do I need a referral to see an Orthopedic doctor?

You can schedule a direct appointment with an orthopedic specialist at their clinic or healthcare center.
While a referral from a general physician is sometimes provided after initial assessment of



musculoskeletal issues, it's not always required for an orthopedic consultation.
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