
Dr Abhisek Nanda
MBBS, DNB (MEDICINE), DM (NEUROLOGY)
10 + Years experience

Dr Abhisek Nanda is a top Neurologist in Rourkela at Apollo Super Speciality Hospital
Rourkela . Book appointment online with Dr Abhisek Nanda at Ask Apollo.

Hospitals

Apollo Super Speciality Hospital, Rourkela

Doctor's Working Weekdays

Mon-Sat

Doctor's Working Hours

09:00-17:00

Doctor's Slot Timings

MON - 09:00 -13:00 TUE - 09:00 -13:00 WED - 09:00 -13:00 THU - 09:00 -13:00 FRI -
09:00 -13:00 SAT - 09:00 -13:00 MON - 09:00 -13:00 TUE - 09:00 -13:00 WED - 09:00

https://dev-apollohospitals-d10.specbee.site/hospitals/apollo-super-speciality-hospital-rourkela


-13:00 THU - 09:00 -13:00 FRI - 09:00 -13:00 SAT - 09:00 -13:00 MON - 09:00 -17:00
TUE - 09:00 -17:00 WED - 09:00 -17:00 THU - 09:00 -17:00 FRI - 09:00 -17:00 SAT -
09:00 -17:00

Overview

Dr. Abhisek Nanda is a highly skilled neurologist based in Sundargarh, Odisha,
bringing over a decade of experience in the field of neurology to his patients. With
qualifications including a DM in Neurology and DNB in Medicine, Dr. Nanda is
dedicated to advancing the forefront of neurological care. He is proficient in various
languages, including English, Hindi, Odia, and Oriya, which allows him to
communicate effectively with a diverse patient base. His expertise encompasses a
wide range of neurological disorders, ensuring that his patients receive
comprehensive evaluations and personalized treatment plans. As a member of the
Apollo healthcare network, Dr. Nanda upholds the institution's reputation for
excellence in patient care. While he has not publicly highlighted any specific awards,
his commitment to patient health and well-being is evident in every interaction.
Patients can expect a professional yet compassionate approach, characterized by his
meticulous attention to detail and a profound understanding of complex neurological
conditions. With his extensive knowledge and experience, Dr. Nanda strives to
provide the highest quality of care, helping patients navigate their health challenges
with confidence. Whether dealing with chronic migraines, epilepsy, or
neurodegenerative diseases, Dr. Abhisek Nanda is dedicated to enhancing his
patients' quality of life through thorough diagnosis and innovative treatment
options.

Experience

SCB Medical College, Cuttack
IMS and SUM Hospital, Bhubaneswar

Awards

F.MAS - Fellowship in minimal access surgery (World Association of Laparoscopic
Surgeons) – AUGUST 2014



D.MAS - Diploma in minimal access surgery (World Association of laparoscopic
Surgeons) – AUGUST 2014

Gyan Burman Fellow in Surgical Gastroenterology & Liver transplant. (Sir Gangaram
Hospital; Delhi) (IHPBA) - FEB-MAY 2015

Fellow In Robotic Surgery (ASAN Medical Center, Seoul; South Korea) –

JULY – NOV 2016

Fellow in HBP& GI Surgery (ASAN Medical Center, Seoul; South Korea) –

JULY -NOV 2016

FIAGES – Fellow of the Indian association of Gastrointestinal-Endo surgeons. OCT
2017

FELLOW IN HBP – Komagome Metropolitan Center for cancer and infectious diseases.
March 2018 – Current (Tokyo; Japan)

Special Interests

Movement Disorder and Stroke

Membership

Member Of International Movement of Disorder Society.

Frequently Asked Questions

Where does Dr. Abhisek Nanda practice?

Dr. Abhisek Nanda currently practices at Apollo Super Speciality Hospital, located in
Rourkela.



Who is Dr. Abhisek Nanda?

Dr. Abhisek Nanda is a highly experienced Neurologist with 10 years of expertise in
the field. He is known for providing exceptional patient care and advanced medical
treatments.

Why do patients choose Dr. Abhisek Nanda?

Patients trust Dr. Abhisek Nanda for his expertise, patient-centric approach, and
commitment to providing the highest standard of care. He is well-versed in the latest
medical advancements and ensures personalized treatment for every patient.

What is Dr. Abhisek Nanda's specialization?

Dr. Abhisek Nanda specializes in Neurology, with expertise in Thrombolysis for
Stroke, Deep Brain Stimulation, Botox for Migraines, Nerve Conduction Studies,
Seizure Management.

What are Dr. Abhisek Nanda's medical qualifications?

Dr. Abhisek Nanda holds prestigious qualifications, including MBBS, DNB (MEDICINE),
DM (NEUROLOGY).

How many years of experience does Dr. Abhisek Nanda have?

Dr. Abhisek Nanda has 10 years of experience in the medical field, treating various
conditions related to Neurology.

How can I book an appointment with Dr. Abhisek Nanda?

You can book an appointment with Dr. Abhisek Nanda through:
Online: Visit [https://www.apollohospitals.com/book-doctor-appointment/](
https://www.apollohospitals.com/book-doctor-appointment/) to schedule an
appointment.

https://www.apollohospitals.com/book-doctor-appointment/
https://www.apollohospitals.com/book-doctor-appointment/

